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Dance World Cup 2023 
 

120,000 dancers from 62 countries attempt to 
reach the Dance World Cup. The top 6.25% 
(7500) make it. 
This year Ayla (Y6) and Atlanta (Y4) McCrory 
qualified to represent England in Portugal 
Braga, 30 June - 8th July.  
Both girls won medals. 
 
Ayla: Silver. 
Atlanta: 2 x Gold, 2 x Silver, 1 x Bronze. 
Atlanta's group also took the overall title for 
the most outstanding small group. 
 
A massive  
congratulations to 
both girls for their 
success which was 
achieved by their  
determination and 
dedication to reach 
their goal.  

Carbon Ruins 

As reported in the last Friday Issue, Carbon 

Ruins is an exhibition set in the year 2050 

when we have reached zero carbon. Pupils 

and students from across Manchester have 

selected 12 objects from today that would be 

displayed in the Carbon Ruins exhibition;   

representing the change that must have    

happened to reach net zero.   

Carbon Ruins, Manchester is a project for 

schools from Manchester Museum.  
A big congratulations to Hermoine and 
Hudson in JEDE for their successful entry 
which now forms part of the exhibition!!  

To see the exhibition online, which is now live, 
please click on the link below. 

https:carbonruinsmanchester.wordpress.com/
carbon-ruins-manchester-online-exhibition-
2023/.  

https://carbonruinsmanchester.wordpress.com/carbon-ruins-manchester-online-exhibition-2023/
https://carbonruinsmanchester.wordpress.com/carbon-ruins-manchester-online-exhibition-2023/
https://carbonruinsmanchester.wordpress.com/carbon-ruins-manchester-online-exhibition-2023/


 

   
   

                                     Green Lane, Heaton Norris, Stockport ,SK4 2NF                                                                                                                     

Tel No: 0161 7323944 Fax No: 0161 975 5114 www.norrisbank.stockport  

  Friday 21st July 2023        Issue No: 19 

Football 
Semi-Final 
Last Wednesday, the football team took part 
in their cup semi-final against Disley. It was a 
really tough game but they all played so well. 
They showed phenomenal spirit, teamwork 
and determination and should have won the 
game in normal time. However, it went to    
extra time and then penalties. A great save 
from our goalkeeper, Parry, and then all five 
of our penalties scored, secured our place in 
the final. A fantastic achievement against one 
of the best teams around, who got to       
Wembley a few weeks before playing us! 
Players of the Match—Storr for being solid at 
the back and Parry for some crucial saves 
(including a penalty in the shootout). 
 
Final 
This Wednesday was the final of the cup. 42 
teams entered the competition and our team 
made it down to the final two! Unfortunately, it 
was not our day and Pownall Green were   
deserving winners. Norris Bank kept going 
and made everyone watching very proud. The 
boys did amazing to even get to the final and 
should focus on a great performance to get 
them to the final against one of the best teams 
in the country. Man of the Match-Toal for   
never giving up, great tackles and crucial 
headers. 
 
We could not be more proud of what they 
achieved and to get to the final 2 teams out of 
42 was amazing! Well done to them all. 
 
Mrs Buchanan 
and  Mr Worth 

Year 6 Fun and Frolics 
 

Year 6 performed their production of  ‘Star 
Warts—The Umpire Strikes Back’ for the 
school and parents this week. The children 
threw themselves into the performances with 
enthusiasm. Judging by the applause at all 
performances, the production was enjoyed by 
all who watched. 
 
Well done Year 6! 
 
On Wednesday they took part in a silent    
disco as part of their leavers activities. It was 
an interesting sight to see! They also enjoyed 
pizza for lunch, all of which was provided by 
the PTA. 
 
In the afternoon, a rounders match took place 
between Year 6 and staff. It was a                  
resounding win for the staff and thoroughly    
enjoyed by all  
taking part and  
everyone watching. 
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And Finally…… 

This is the last Friday Issue of academic year 
2022/2023. 

Norris Bank wishes all of Year 6, any other 
child and staff members who are leaving for 
pastures new, the very best of luck for the  
future.  

As the summer holidays gallop upon us, enjoy 
whatever you have planned and, in the words 
of a very old programme— 

‘Let’s be careful out there.’ (Hill Street 
Blues—ask your parents!) 

Green Lane Allotment Society 
 
Are having their Open Day and Annual Show 
on Sunday July 23rd from 1.30 to 4.00pm on 
their Green Lane, Heaton Moor site. 
Stalls will include plants, fresh produce, home 
bake and preserves, tombola, refeshments, 
BBQ, Pimms and children's activities. 
Trophies to be presented at 3.30pm by        
Navendu Mishra MP 
 
Admission-£1.00 children FREE 

 Funtopia 
 

Funtopia – The BIG Day Out for Little Kids is 
coming to Stockport this June as part of our 
UK summer Tour. The event is specifically  
designed for children under the age of 10, with 
all of the activities included in the entry price. 
Activities include high energy inflatables, role 
play areas, under 5’s area, baby zone, activity 
arena, sumo suits, giant inflatable games and 
more! 
 We aim to be accessible to everyone. This is 
why we offer incredibly low prices, daily SEND 
sessions and donate hundreds of free tickets 
every year to families in need. 
 We want all families to be able to enjoy  
Funtopia and, considering the cost of living at 
the moment, not everyone can afford family 
days out. Funtopia is one of the cheapest  
children’s festival in the UK. With a full day 
pass costing only £10 per child, £2.50 per 
adult and children under 90cm are free! 
 This year Funtopia is holding an Autism 
Friendly Session at the start of the event to   
allow neurodiverse children and families the 
chance to enjoy the event as well, in a much 
quieter session with the addition of sensory 
activities! More details on these sessions can 
be found on our FB page www.facebook.com/
funtopiauk 
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Toys Wanted 
 

Do you have any large toys, which are in 
good condition, suitable for outdoor use that 
your child no longer plays with?  
 
For example; kitchens, workbenches, play 
Mobil equipment, cars etc. 
 
These will be used by KS1 and Branching 
Out.  
 
Please bring any donations to the office for 
the attention of Mrs Stanley. 

http://www.facebook.com/funtopiauk
http://www.facebook.com/funtopiauk
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If you need to contact a member of staff, follow the link below to our web page: 

http://norrisbank.stockport.sch.uk/staff-contact-information/ 

Remember the email will not be read until possibly that evening or the following day.   
Please consider the contents of the email before sending it. 

 
 
 
 

Date Description 

Wednesday 26th July Year 6 Leavers assembly  

W/B 27th July INSET Day: School closed for the summer 

  

Monday 4th September Inset Day—school closed 

Tuesday 5th September School re-opens 

Tuesday 5th and Wednesday 6th 
September 

New Reception children and parents meetings 

Week beginning Monday 11th 
September 

Year 1-6 Meet the Teacher (details to be sent later) 

Friday 22nd September PTA Family Games Night 

Week beginning Monday 25th 
September 

Year R Meet the Teacher (details to be sent later) 

Monday 2nd October Black History Month 

Tuesday 10th October 
Open Day for Reception children due to start in     

September 2024 

Thursday 12th October Individual Photos 

Friday 13th October Harvest Fair 

Tuesday 17th October Year 6 screening 

Wednesday 18th October PTA Hallowe’en Disco 

Thursday 19th October School Closes for the October Half Term 

http://norrisbank.stockport.sch.uk/staff-contact-information/

